
healing. 
      In spite of it all the 
Lord, our God, proved 
that He would never leave 
us nor forsake us through 
the testimonies of the 
young people as they 
searched for Him and 
began finding Him in their 
own, personal way. 
      During these months 
self esteem was built, 
young people were 
converted, and a stronger 
relationship was built 
between the staff and the 
students. The team threw 

themselves into the 
work and the village 
witnessed the 
steadfastness of the 
workers of Christ 
through the adversities 

of life.   
 

The last week of school 
was an emotional one as 
the students and staff said 
goodbye to one of the 
toughest semesters in the 
school’s history. 
     The empty desks in the 
classrooms were still 
noticeable, and the 
names of the eleven 
girls who were no 
longer at school were 
continuously 
mentioned, with 
painful sadness. 
     The devil showed 
the controlling power 
he has over those who 
are not totally 
submitted to Christ by 
taking over the bodies 
of these girls and 
using them to cause 
sleepless nights for family 
and the volunteers.  
       In hurting these girls, 
he put fear in some and 
strengthened the faith of 

others through his horrible 
displays, for a month,  in 
the lives of these young 
ladies. 
     November and 
December were used to 
pick up the pieces, to 

search for answers to their 
endless questions, to 
rebuild the brokenness of 
students, staff, and 
parents, and to focus on 

Not left or forsaken 

Dedicated Workers for the King 

  Siparuta Mission 

Academy was blessed this 

semester with hard-

working, God fearing 

volunteers. After the MFL’s 

divided to spread the word 

in other parts of South 

America, the Lord sent 

others to continue the 

work. 

 The dedication of 

these workers was 

evidence of the 

magnificent of God, who 

knows His people and also 

knows to whom He can 

lean on to handle the fight 

during this ardent period 

of the great controversy.  

  The Mann family 

from Michighan, USA, and 

Chenobie Jupiter from 

Essequibo, Guyana, joined 

with the remainder of the 

team labour in Siparuta 

Village.  

 The dedication of 

each family, and the hard 

work of these people was 

seen and felt by all around 

them. Washing and bathing 

in the creek,  cooking on 

the wood fire—May the 

Lord bless them all, as they 

keep at the work that the 

Lord gives them. 

 

Another year 

is at its 

close 

The devotion hall where all major 

gathering happens 

  



     No adjective is qualified 

enough to describe the 

Emotion the students felt as 

they each 

collected a 

Siparuta 

Mission 

Academy polo 

shirt of their 

very own. 

      A year 

earlier, the 

Administrators saw a golden 

opportunity as they listened 

to their friend proudly speak 

of the charity work his then 

employers did. They shared 

with their friend, the school's 

need for a branded t-shirt for 

the students to wear on 

special days. 

     The 

'yes' was 

announced to the already 

enthusiastic students via 

speaker phone. Then the wait 

began. A challenge was given 

for interested students to 

design a logo for the 

clothing, Phylino Williams and 

Merol Morris found pleasure 

in diligently creating the 

accepted piece. 

      Two semesters later and  

the wait was forgotten and 

forgiven as the students of 

Siparuta Mission Academy 

held their very first logoed 

school clothing. 

      The shirts are currently 

being worn as a second 

school top by those who had 

but one. There appreciation is 

also shown in the extra care 

that is taken when the polo's 

are worn. Certain games are 

left for another time as to 

avoid soiling. 

     Thanks to Anthony Peters 

Visit our website at 

http://mfl.isteaching.com/

support-our-mission.html 

 Or 

http://gospelministry.org/

donations/  

Tag the donation SMA and 

the need you are donating to 

 We are very grateful 

for the support over the past 

year. Keep praying for us as 

we finish the work. 

 $360 for 6 walls. 4 sacks 

of cement per wall. 

 $30 for 2 sacks cement 

to do flooring on girls 

dorm 

 $100 for textbooks 

 

 

Richard and Tamara 
+592-648-2185 
 
Tamara.mfl@gmail.com 
 
Lawrence.mfl@gmail.com 
 
www.facebook.com/
missionaryforlife 

The T-Shirt’s Arrived 

Present needs  How to Donate    Contact Us 

years before.  After they 

worked out the cement, the 

work hours, and the labours 

(themselves), they excitedly 

walked together to the boat 

and asked a parent to do the 

purchase for them. 

 A few days later, the 

making of the blocks began. 

And six weeks later the first 

wall was erected. Amazing. 

This has taken a while, and 

the wall may not be the most 

perfectly done but its 

structurally safe and the 

sealing will be done 

professionally.     But, most 

of all, the students did it and 

they are very proud of 

themselves and their 

We have a wall!!!! 
 In September the 

form three class sat down 

with their teacher and 

decided that it was time to 

separate the classrooms. 

They decided that they would 

love to be able to block out 

the distractions from around 

them, and to settle down and 

focus on their last three years 

of school. 

 That was music to 

their teachers ears, as she 

has wanted that since she 

arrived at the school three 
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